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CAUTION

Please refer to the SDS for more detailed 
precautionary measures, handling 
instructions, and emergency procedures.
KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN.

FEATURES

•  Non-staining, water resistant

•  All-weather, all-purpose

•  Heat resistant to 350°F

DIRECTIONS

1. Shake can vigorously for one minute 
    after mixing ball begins to rattle

2. Spray on a clean, dry surface from a 
    distance of 6 to 8 inches

3. Insert extension tube into actuator 
    orifice for pinpoint application

4. Tube package included in carton

5. Repeat application periodically

 
 
 
 
 
 

FIRST-AID

Eyes: Rinse eyes cautiously with lukewarm 
water while holding eyelids open for several 
minutes. Remove contact lenses if easy to do 
so. Continue rinsing for 15–20 minutes. Take 
care not to rinse contaminated water into 
unaffected eye or face. If irritation persists, 
get medical attention.

Skin: Remove contaminated clothing. Gently 
blot or brush away excess product. Wash 
with lukewarm water for 15–20 minutes. If 
feeling unwell, get medical attention.

Inhalation: Remove to fresh air and assist 
breathing as necessary—get medical 
attention if feeling unwell.

Ingestion: Rinse mouth. Do NOT induce 
vomiting. Get medical attention.

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

DESCRIPTION
Speed White is a heavy-duty white grease 
spray that penetrates like an oil, then 
cures to a thick, water resistant grease. It is 
often used in industrial, marine, aircraft, 
automotive, farm, home, or office areas. 
Speed White is ideal for linkages, slides, 
bearings, chains, small gears, hinges, 
tools, cranks, worms and rollers.


